

BID TABULATION

Bid #18-31

Aluminized Corrugated Metal Pipe – Annual Contract

Round Aluminized Type 2 Metal Pipe (Smooth Interior (GDOT Std 1030D, Table No. 1 R, with Manning's 'n' of +/- 0.012): Includes one soil tight band. Includes price per foot, and includes items A through C in section 1.0

| Item No. | Size Diameter | Cherokee Culvert Co., Inc. | | | Ferguson Waterworks | | |
|----------|---------------|----------------------------|---------|----------|---------------------|---------|----------|
| | | Unit Price/Linear | | | Unit Price/Linear | | |
| | | 16 Gage | 14 Gage | 12 Gage | 16 Gage | 14 Gage | 12 Gage |
| 1 | 18 | \$13.97 | \$17.52 | No Bid | \$16.79 | \$19.72 | No Bid |
| 2 | 24 | \$19.10 | \$23.74 | \$33.07 | \$21.27 | \$26.29 | \$38.58 |
| 3 | 30 | \$23.88 | \$29.67 | \$41.34 | \$26.86 | \$32.86 | \$45.00 |
| 4 | 36 | \$29.70 | \$37.52 | \$51.89 | \$32.46 | \$39.43 | \$53.58 |
| 5 | 42 | \$34.87 | \$43.72 | \$60.93 | \$36.93 | \$46.00 | \$62.15 |
| 6 | 48 | \$40.08 | \$50.29 | \$70.05 | \$42.58 | \$52.58 | \$70.72 |
| 7 | 54 | \$51.36 | \$61.49 | \$85.68 | \$50.36 | \$59.15 | \$80.36 |
| 8 | 60 | | \$68.33 | \$95.20 | | \$65.72 | \$88.93 |
| 9 | 72 | | | \$114.24 | | | \$106.08 |
| 10 | 84 | | | \$140.90 | | | \$124.29 |

Round Aluminized Type 2 Metal Pipe (GDOT Std 1030D, Table No. 1), with Manning's n of +/- 0.022): Includes one soil tight band. Includes price per foot, and includes items A through C in section 1.0

| Item No. | Size Diameter | Cherokee Culvert Co., Inc. | | | Ferguson Waterworks | | |
|----------|---------------|----------------------------|---------|----------|---------------------|---------|---------|
| | | Unit Price/Linear | | | Unit Price/Linear | | |
| | | 16 Gage | 14 Gage | 12 Gage | 16 Gage | 14 Gage | 12 Gage |
| 1 | 15 | \$10.57 | | | \$13.37 | | |
| 2 | 18 | \$12.62 | \$16.06 | \$22.14 | \$16.71 | \$19.84 | \$36.36 |
| 3 | 24 | \$16.72 | \$21.27 | \$29.33 | \$21.17 | \$26.45 | \$45.18 |
| 4 | 30 | \$20.81 | \$26.48 | \$36.51 | \$26.74 | \$33.06 | \$53.99 |
| 5 | 36 | \$26.05 | \$33.14 | \$45.70 | \$33.00 | \$40.10 | \$63.49 |
| 6 | 42 | \$30.52 | \$38.85 | \$53.55 | \$38.69 | \$46.78 | \$72.40 |
| 7 | 48 | \$35.04 | \$44.60 | \$61.50 | \$43.24 | \$53.47 | \$81.31 |
| 8 | 54 | \$43.18 | \$51.89 | \$75.11 | No Bid | \$60.80 | \$91.19 |
| 9 | 60 | \$47.88 | \$60.98 | \$83.38 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| 10 | 72 | \$58.29 | \$74.22 | \$102.34 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| 11 | 84 | \$67.86 | \$86.44 | \$119.15 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |